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Curriculum Plans – Year 9 - English – Academic Year 2023/24 

 
 
Please find below a detailed outline of the curriculum covered in English through Year 9 in key stage 3.  
 
 

BLOCK 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 

Dates 28th August 
- 27th 

September 
(5 weeks) 

2nd October 
- 27th 

October 
(4 weeks) 

6th 
November - 

15th 
December 
(6 weeks) 

3rd January - 
2nd 

February 
(5 weeks) 

12th 
February - 

22nd March 
(6 weeks) 

2nd April - 
26th April 
(4 weeks) 

6th May - 
21st June 
(7 weeks) 

Topics Novel - Animal Farm 
 
Exploring the context of the 
novella and understanding its 
historical importance 
 
Developing an understanding 
of the themes in the novella 
 
Analysing literary techniques, 
forms and devices 
 
Evaluating how Orwell uses 
language to deliver his 
message and whether that 
message is convincing 

Drama - DNA 
 
Considering the conventions 
of dramatic texts and 
comparing them to prose and 
poetry. 
 
Examining the context of the 
play and relating it to other 
texts we’ve studied. 
 
Reflecting on the dramatic 
process, which may include: 

- Staging 
- Storyboarding 
- Scriptwriting 

 
Responding to a dramatic 
text in writing while 
considering playwright’s 
intention and audience 
response 

Poetry of 
Conflict 
 
Analysing 
poetic 
techniques, 
forms and 
devices  
 
Showing a 
critical 
understandin
g 
 
Exploring 
themes and 
sharing 
personal 
responses 
 
Developing 
communicati
on and 
presentation 
skills  
 
Understandi
ng the 
historical 
context of 
the poems 

Novel - Of Mice and Men 
 
Exploring the context of the 
novella and understanding its 
historical importance 
 
Develop an understanding of 
the themes in the novella 
 
Analysing  literary 
techniques, forms and 
devices 
 
Drawing links between 
historical and contemporary 
social issues 
 
Reflecting on the issue of 
social responsibility and how 
such ideas change over time 
 

Assessments Creative 
writing - 
persuasive 

Essay - 
textual 
analysis 

Creative 
writing - 
narrative 

Essay - 
textual 
analysis 

Essay - 
textual 
analysis 

Creative 
writing - 
descriptive 

Essay - 
textual 
analysis 

Academic 
Theme 

Planning for 
Tomorrow 

The World 
around us 

Better 
Together 

The Working 
World 

Opportunitie
s for 
Everyone  

Keep it 
Green, Keep 
it Clean  

Healthy 
Body, 
Healthy 
Mind  

 


